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VRG Components Hosts Grand Opening for New Corporate 

Headquarters & Warehouse 

CHARLOTTE, NC USA (October 13, 2023) – VRG Components, Inc., a leading global independent 
distributor of electronic components, hosted a grand opening event to celebrate the opening of its new 
corporate headquarters and warehouse. The evening began with a blessing from Reverend Jackie 
Robertson and an official ribbon-cutting ceremony. Customers from as far away as Germany, suppliers, local 
officials, and business associates were given tours of the property while enjoying a variety of fun activities, 
carnival-inspired food, and local craft beer on tap. Located at 3056 Eaton Avenue in Indian Trail, NC, the 
new free-standing building offers expansive office space, a dedicated ESD-safe (Electrostatic Discharge) 
area for component inspection and testing, and a large warehouse with multiple loading docks. 

VRG owners and co-founders, Verena Martin and Ruben Gutierrez, had been actively searching for the right 
property to support the company’s growth and found it in late 2022.  Renovations to accommodate ESD-
safe component inspection and handling, temperature and humidity-controlled component storage, as well 
as quality, logistics, purchasing, accounting, human resources, sales, marketing, and management offices 
took several months to complete.   

“As we approach our 10-year anniversary, investing in this free-standing office building and warehouse is 
critical to the growth of VRG Components,” said CEO Verena Martin.  “It is strategically located near a 
major Charlotte travel corridor ideal for attracting candidates from the region’s well-educated talent pool. 
Now that we are moved in, it was important to celebrate this milestone in our history.”   
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The larger office areas provide much needed space for the company’s teams to accommodate its growth.  
The new ESD-safe component inspection, handling, and shipping areas as well as the expansive 
warehousing areas allow VRG to offer additional new services to its global customers. The building and 
property are equipped with the latest technology including EV charging stations for employees, suppliers, 
customers, and other visitors.  

About VRG Components 

As a woman-owned AS9120B/ISO 9001:2015 certified independent global distributor, VRG Components 
supplies the highest quality hard-to-find, end-of-life, highly allocated, and long lead time electronic 
components enabling customers to maintain manufacturing operations, bridge supply gaps, reduce costs, 
manage inventory, and speed time to market.  Manufacturers around the world turn to VRG Components 
to keep their supply chains intact, reduce carrying costs, minimize the effects of price increases or shortages, 
and achieve accuracy in cost planning. 

The company, a WBENC-certified Women’s Business Enterprise, is a three-time Inc. 5000 winner and a 
2023 Supply Chain Connect Top 50 Global Electronics Distributor. 

VRG Components is a privately held company based in Charlotte, NC.  For more information visit their 
website and LinkedIn, Facebook, Instagram, and YouTube pages. 
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